

Your Reference:  
 Your Contact: Ms Elizabeth Stevens  
 Our Reference: CP5/PRE052/2155/LAP  
 Invoice Number: 359795

## Professional Services

Date	Name	Hours	Details
06/12/16	S73 RTI		
07/12/16			
13/12/16			
15/12/16			
15/12/16			
19/12/16		1.6	Attendance telephone discussion with D Herbert; conferring with P Lack; telephone discussion with E Wilson; emails from or to P Lack, N Inglis, D Maroske, J Forster, T Humphreys, P Shaddock and M Rallings
19/12/16		4.9	Attendance to further review of final Report and noting matters for redaction and preparation of relevant chapters for provision to those with separate representation
19/12/16		2.0	Perusing Review Report
20/12/16		3.2	Attendance to further review of final Report and undertaking confidentiality redactions to Report
20/12/16		2.4	Perusing Review Report
21/12/16		1.7	Attendance to further review and redaction of final Report
22/12/16		2.5	Attendance to further review and redaction requirements to the final Report
23/12/16		0.5	Attendance to further review and redaction of Confidential Report material
23/12/16			
10/01/17			
10/01/17		2.8	Attendance to discussions with P Lack regarding advice and redaction requirements and consider further review to volume 2 of Report regarding redaction requirements
10/01/17			
11/01/17			
11/01/17		5.7	Attendance to further review of Confidential Report regarding confidentiality and marking as required and meeting with P Lack regarding advice as requested, findings, recommendations and major matters to be raised and assist in drafting advice to the Attorney-General
11/01/17		5.8	Drafting memo to Attorney-General regarding Report and confidentiality issues (including perusing various sections of Report)
12/01/17			

Your Reference:  
 Your Contact: Ms Elizabeth Stevens  
 Our Reference: CP5/PRE052/2155/LAP  
 Invoice Number: 359795

Date	Name	Hours	Details
	S73 RTI		
13/01/17		0.7	Drafting, checking and amending draft memo to Attorney-General
13/01/17		5.4	Attendance to further review of Confidential Report regarding redaction and confidentiality requirements and mark accordingly
13/01/17			
16/01/17		5.3	Attendance to further review and identification of confidentiality and redactions to Confidential Report
17/01/17		3.4	Attendance to further review and redaction to Confidential Report
18/01/17		1.4	Attendance to final review and determining matters for confidentiality and redaction and label accordingly
<b>Total</b>			

**Summary of professional services**

Name	Position	Rate	Hours	Amount